
COMMITTEE OF SAFETY SOLUTION

Whether you have been a student with the Sacramento Constitution Group or have 
realized on your own that something can be done in the saving of our Republic, you are 
welcome to browse the documents and solutions mentioned here. Hopefully you’ve 
found that it is now time to put that education and passion for liberty into action and 
defend the Republic of California. Multiple generations of lies from the media, and poor 
education have put us in a terribly compromised position.

From earliest history right up to 1760, a reading of history shows that a few men have 
always dominated the rest of humanity. There was always slavery in existence of one 
sort or another. Between 1760 and 1776, colonists in the new world of America were 
forced into a war which tested their resolve, as well as the resolve and love of their 
wives and families. And for their courage, fortitude and inspiration we are forever 
grateful because those courageous men signed a new Declaration of human liberty, 
unique in all of history. And from that first pronouncement, they went on to form a 
Republican form of Government giving the people responsibility for keeping their new-
found liberty in good health. 

However, at this point in history (2023), we find ourselves in nearly the same situation, if 
not worse as our Founders found themselves in when they separated from England. 
People up and down the state of California and all over the Republic are hungry for 
solutions and are feeling powerless in the face of being steam rolled even harder than 
usual during the last three years, and now the steam roller is amping up its force and 
fury, running naked to the finish line. Which means those who want control and 
dominion over the world care not what they have to do to win. They’re dropping the 
deceit they have used for over a hundred years and are ruthlessly breaking the Law of 
the Land in their incessant grab for world dominance.

The Founders, though, told us in their writings that We the People are the final check 
and balance on our government. We’ve forgotten a huge number of principles about this 
country, embedded in the Constitution, which are still true. They’re just waiting to be 
rediscovered by a critical mass of Americans.

The 1st Principle is that there is a Creator, or Higher Power in this Universe who gave 
We the People the highest authority in our system of government. The Constitution of 
the United States and each state constitution since then, were written by a few, but 
ratified by The People as a whole, to protect our God-given rights to life, liberty and 
property. The founding documents were written to create the government by declaring to 
those we appoint through election that they are delegated with only certain duties. In 
these documents we have told them specifically what they are allowed to do.

Unfortunately, We the People have not enforced the constitutions even once throughout 
its history, and we’ve been lulled to sleep by the surge of energy and productivity that 
liberty sets in motion when allowed.



2nd Principle: The Constitution is the law, and all levels of government are limited by it. 
If we think it is too difficult to understand, we are wrong. Thomas Jefferson said, “Laws 
are made for men of ordinary understanding, and should therefore be construed by the 
ordinary rules of common sense. Their meaning is not to be sought for in metaphysical 
subtleties which make anything mean everything or nothing, at pleasure.”

Upholding the Law of the Land means we acknowledge and look to the Constitution 
first, before we acknowledge any legislative acts. If any level of government does 
something that we did not give them authority to do, then it is unlawful. The founders 
called this “pretend” legislation.

3rd Principle: George Washington said about the Constitution, “Its only keepers are the 
people.” Government workers are public servants, and they cannot be expected to 
police themselves. That job was given to We the People, since we are the only higher 
authority, under God, that can hold our servants accountable. This was confirmed as 
late as 1950 in U.S. Supreme Court Case American Communications Association v. 
Douds when the court ruled, “It is not the function of our government to keep the citizen 
from falling into error; it is the function of the citizen to keep the government from falling 
into error.” — U.S. Supreme Court in American Communications Association v. Douds 
339 U.S. 382, 442 (1950)

Everyone in the various freedom groups in all 58 counties in California are the keepers 
of the Constitution. Our freedom is conditional only on our willingness to keep it. And 
what does that mean? Holding our servants accountable.

4th Principle: So how do we do that? First, we must know what’s in the Constitution. In 
our Constitution Discussion Group we study it according to original intent. Then when 
we recognize something is unlawful, or that it is pretend legislation, we must choose to 
not comply so that we’re not partaking of the crime. Ignoring pretend legislation is an act 
of following the law. If we and large numbers of others are successful in ignoring these 
unjust laws, then we have succeeded, by making it irrelevant
.
5th Principle: Our right to gather in any size group is the fundamental right we need to 
hold them accountable. This is why, when the Covid debacle was instigated, many 
governors went after our right to gather in groups. Social Distancing is doublespeak for 
destroying our right to assemble. Force, fear and discrimination should be clues that our 
servants are breaking the law, especially when it comes through mandates, executive 
orders and unlawful agencies. This is when we need to stand together and let them 
know that they are breaking the Law of the Land, and we will not acknowledge them, as 
we are upholding the Law as it is written in the Constitution.

We have seen in history that individuals can many times make a difference on their 
own. However, when we are gathered into groups, we have the right to tell the 
government when it is breaking the law, and this gives each individual more power as 
well as protection. This is part of petitioning for redress. Individuals and groups can all 
document instances of the usurpation of power. And the larger the group the more 



powerful the message received by the servants.

6th Principle: The founders called themselves into groups and set an example of what 
to do to overthrow a tyrannous government. Towns, counties and colonies from Nova 
Scotia to Georgia, had their own Committees of Correspondence and/or Committees of 
Safety. People on these committees wrote to each other to express ideas, to confirm 
mutual assistance and to debate and coordinate resistance to British imperial policy. 

The network created by these committees organized and mobilized hundreds of 
communities across the colonies. An influential one was called the Loyal 9, started by 
Samuel Adams by gathering eight friends around him. It kept growing and later became 
known as the Sons of Liberty. They were the group which instigated the Boston Tea 
Party, Paul Revere’s ride and more. All up and down the colonies Committees were 
formed outside the king’s government. The cream of the crop of leaders from each of 
the colonies were those who finally met in the First Continental Congress in 1774. And 
again, in the subsequent Constitutional Congress, the people elected their most 
knowledgeable representatives to get things straightened out. 

This diverse group of men, having studied liberty movements, as well as Common Law 
in world history, were also inspired by God, or a Higher Power. They thus formed the 
most unique government in the world, allowing people the freedom to live their 
conscience and to reach their human potential.

Through this brief story I am introducing the idea of “Committees of Safety” – the very 
same method that our founding fathers used to take control of their local governments. 
These “Committeemen” built the nation we inherited, which is now being lost to tyrants. 
We the People through the true elected Committeemen at the grass roots level can and 
will (with your participation) take control by starting at the local level and simultaneously 
on the state level.

Eventually we’ll gather with other states going to the federal level of government by 
simply requiring them to obey the “Supreme Law of the Land” and thereby perform their 
Constitutional duties. Like most things, it is a simple idea, but not necessarily easy.

It is time to gather all the individual freedom groups in California into larger committees 
where we can learn to effectively write resolutions and declarations which can be signed 
by an ever-growing number of groups, representing an even larger number of people 
who are letting their servants know that we expect them to follow the law, not twist 
what’s already there or change word meanings to suit their greed for power. Organizing 
and coordinating in this way will allow all of us to participate according to the skills, 
talents and time we have available
. 
We’re just getting our feet wet with the idea of the Committee method they left us. So 
even though it is a huge task, gathering and documenting the lawlessness we see 
before us, many hands can make light work as we build our relationships, each 
contributing our special talent, no matter what it is. Together we are stronger. 



Very few of us know what Government by Consent means, and what participation by 
We the People involves. It's time to start learning, in structurally organized Committees, 
how many of us really do value liberty for ourselves and our posterity. We’ve all heard 
the phrase “There’s more of us than there are of them.” But it certainly doesn’t feel like 
it, does it. They are using Natural Law tools to their advantage. But we can learn to use 
those same tools to our advantage.

This is an ideological battle, and the other side is organized, has money and controls 
the media. We can learn to create our own media, do deep diving research, organize 
and use the principles I just went through to restore the Republic.

We are looking for stout-hearted men and women who are ready to defend the Republic 
using Natural Law and the Constitution – everything done according to the law of the 
Land. We can no longer watch our numbers diminish as our children, families and 
neighbors get brainwashed. 

If you are ready to sacrifice some of your time, money and skills in the pursuit of liberty, 
please look further on this website for descriptions of our activities and the commitment 
we’re asking from you in order to participate.


